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The article considers the formulation of the 
problem of strategic management at enterprise. 
It is suggested a mathematical model with the 
use of the Theory of Constraints (ТОС) by 
Eliyahu Goldratt and the theory of fuzzy set. 
Technologies on the basis of the brought theo-
ries over give an opportunity adequately to for-
malize a weekend given for analytical tasks to 
the concrete operating of enterprise conditions. 
Primary purposes are considered for introduc-
tion of strategy: accordance of products with 
the international standards; high level of trust 
of products’ consumer; high efficiency of the 
sale system of enterprise. Together with indexes 
that are characterized by quantitative values, 
description of the state and analysis of quality 
indexes are executed by means of the use of 
special methods of presentation and processing 
of unclear data.

On the results of undertaken study it is estab-
lished that for the achievement of the put aims 
of enterprise the quality changes of production 
technology level and innovative activity are 
needed. These changes will carry out correspond-

ing influence on the estimation of other param-
eters of environment that will allow to attain the 
indicated level of trust of consumer to quality of 
commodity that answers the value indicated in a 
strategic vector 0,7. With the indicated transfor-
mations minimum influence on an enterprise, at 
which selected strategy can be realized and indi-
cated strategic aims attained, comes true.

The solution of strategic management task 
with the use of the Theory of Constraints (ТОС) 
by Eliyahu Goldratt and the theory of fuzzy set 
connection allows determining of external and 
internal aims, taking into account influence of 
parameters with the different degree of definite-
ness, getting the quantitative criteria of develop-
ment on the basis of quality descriptions analysis.

The main task of strategy estimation is cre-
ation of model that will allow defining the state 
and co-operation of resources, their effective use 
and further prospects of development. There is 
not simply a reliable and exact method of strat-
egy estimation, so as it will be accept adminis-
trative decisions in the conditions of vagueness, 
deficit of resources, information and time.
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